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Drogos, Donna, Env. Health load3a.

From: Drogos, Donna, Env. Health

Sent:  Friday, November 03, 2006 10:56 AM
To: *Kris McGlothlin'

Ce: Leroy Griffin

Subject: RE: 222 Broadway

Hi Kris,
Deposit is $6000.000 for ACEH oversight.

Payable to: Alameda County Environmental Health
Reference site address on check {after case listing reference will be case number).

Mail or deliver in person to:

Finance Department

Alameda County Environmental Health
1131 Harbor Bay Parkway

Alameda, CA 94502

Please e-mail the contact info (name, address, phone #) for the property owner along with the reports
I spoke to LoRoy & he will transfer the case to us when you send us the above e-mail

Thanks, Donna

Donna L. Drogos, PE

LOP Program Manager

Alameda County Environmental Health
1131 Harbor Bay Parkway

Alameda, CA 94502

510-567-6721
donna.drogos@acgov.org

From: Kris McGlothlin [mailto:kris_mcglothlin@sbcglobal.net)
Sent: Friday, November 03, 2006 10:46 AM

To: Drogos, Donna, Env. Health

Subject: 222 Broadway

Donna,

Good moming. Thank you for taking the time to speak with me regarding the disposition of the site. While [ am
getting the sampling information tabled for you acounts payable needs to know the mailing address for the case
deposit and who to make the check out to.

Thank you

Kris

12/7/2006
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Drogos, Donna, Env. Health 202932,

From: Kris McGlothlin [kris_mcglothlin@sbcglobal.net]
Sent: Friday, November 03, 2006 10:46 AM

To: Drogos, Donna, Env. Health

Subject: 222 Broadway

Donna, |
Good morning. Thank you for taking the time to speak with me regarding the disposition of the site. While I am {
getting the sampling information tabled for you acounts payable needs to know the mailing address for the case |
deposit and who to make the check out to.

i

Thank you

Kris

12/7/2006




