

ALAMEDA COUNTY HAZARDOUS MATERIALS DIVISION
 DEPOSIT / REFUND ACCOUNT SHEET

printed 02/05/99

SITE INFORMATION

Former Ekotek
 4200 Alameda Ave
 Oakland 94601
 Site Contact:
 Site Phone :

StID: 4808	Site#: 3274
PROJECT#:	3274B
PROJECT TYPE:***	A ***
INSP:	Barney Chan
ACCT. SHEET PG #:	_____

PROPERTY OWNER INFORMATION

Owner Contact:
 Owner Phone :

PAYOR INFORMATION

Ekotek, Inc
 300 Atlantic St
 Stanford CT # 954
 Payor Contact:
 Payor Phone :

Date	Action Taken	Time		Hours Spent/ Depstd	Hour Balnce	Money Spent/ Depositd	Money Balance
		In	Out				
_____	Balance from Prev. Page	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____
_____	Rcpt# 799757	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____
02/05/99	Deposit of \$3,000.00 @\$100/hour	_____	_____	+30.	_____	+\$3,000.00	_____
11/17/00	<i>Review file / Dave Williams for B Graham + W. Wick</i>	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____
_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____
_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____
_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____
_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____
_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____
_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____
_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____
_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____	_____

UPON COMPLETION OF PROJECT

PROJ COMPLETED BY : _____ ATTACH: State Forms A, B & C
 Billing Adjustment*
 DATE OF COMPLETION : _____ DATE SENT TO BILLING: _____
 TOTAL COST OF PROJECT: _____ REFUND AMOUNT: _____ Rev. 5/96

* Billing adjustment forms needed when site is in our UST program.

Printed: 12/16/98

***** Alameda County Department of Environmental Health *****
 BILLING's WORKLOG: Total Deposit/Refund History for All Accounts at Site

** SITE INFORMATION **

Site#: 3274 -- StID: 4808 EKOTEK, INC.
 Date Open: 05/31/96 4200 ALAMEDA AVE
 Date Closed: OAKLAND CA 94601

** PAYOR INFORMATION **

> Project # --3274A for Payor # 876 CROSBY, HEAFEY, ROACH & MAY
 1999 HARRISON STREET
 OAKLAND CA 94612

> Project # --3274B for Payor # 954 EKOTEK, INC.
 300 ATLANTIC ST
 STAMFORD CN 6901

** DEPOSIT HISTORY **

Proj#	Deposit Date	Receipt#	Amount Received
--3274A	05/12/95	753074	\$ 2,000.00
--3274A	12/08/95	768112	\$ 1,188.00
			=====
			\$ 3,188.00
--3274B			\$ 2,000.00
--3274B	05/31/96	773010	\$ 5,000.00
	04/29/97	777371	\$
			=====
			\$ 7,000.00

* WORK LOG HISTORY **

Pr	Wo	Mo	Year	Activity Description	Insp	Time (hrs)	Amount Charged
	01/	7	/91	review repor	cc	0.5	\$33.5
--3274	01/	7	/91	District Attorney Time	CC	0.5	\$33.5
--3274	01/3			Review Plans/Reports	CC	0.5	\$33.5
--3274a	01/30		/91	adj.dupl.chg.	adm		-\$33.5
--3274a	01/30		/91	adj.dupl.chg.	cc	0.75	\$50.
--3274a	02/08		/91	DA conference	cc	0.75	\$50.
--3274A	02/08		/91	DA conference	CC	1.5	\$100.
--3274A	09/2		/91	Meetings, Consultations	CC	1.5	\$100.
--3274a	11/0		/93	letter to Jason Lauren	ag	3.5	\$262

**ALAMEDA COUNTY ENVIRONMENTAL HEALTH SERVICES
UNDERGROUND TANK LISTING**

As of December 15, 1998

- 1 -

<u>Business Name & Address</u>	<u>Owner's Name/Phone #</u>	<u>Comments</u>
Ballena Isle Marina 1150 Ballena Blvd. Alameda, CA 94501	Almar, Ltd. Facility Phone: 523-5528	Not Certified
Whitmore Auto Service 1701 Buena Vista Ave. Alameda, CA 94501	Louis Albert Whitmore Facility Phone: 522-3388	Not Certified
Alaska Gasoline 1310 Central Ave. Alameda, CA 94501	Shivchcharantjit Lal / P.S. Facility Phone: 530-8040	Certified
Pacific Bell 2100 Central Ave. Alameda, CA 94501	Pacific Bell Facility Phone: 522-7324	Certified
Pacific Shops, Inc. 1815 Clement Ave. Alameda, CA 94501	Pacific Shops, Inc. Facility Phone: 521-1133	Certified
Svendsen's Boat Works 1851 Clement Ave. Alameda, CA 94501	Svendsen's Boat Works Facility Phone: 522-2886	Not Certified
US Coast Guard Support 0 Coast Guard Island Alameda, CA 94501	US Coast Guard Support Facility Phone: 437-5775	Certified
Maintenance Service Center 1616 Fortman Way Alameda, CA 94501	City of Alameda Facility Phone: 415-748-4520	Certified
Grand Harbor Fuel Dock 2099 Grand St. Alameda, CA 94501	Randall Garrison Facility Phone: 521-3835	Not Certified
Tosco Corporation Site #1 3255 McCartney Rd. Alameda, CA 94501	Tosco Simon Kim	Not Certified

--3274a	11/08/93	letter	ag	3.5	\$262.50
--3274A	03/28/94	Review Plans/Reports	BJ	1.5	\$112.50
--3274A	03/29/94	Investigation On-Site	BJ	1.	\$75.00
--3274A	05/02/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.5	\$45.00
--3274A	05/08/95	District Attorney Time	BC	2.	\$180.00
--3274A	05/08/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	2.	\$180.00
--3274A	05/10/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.3	\$27.00
--3274a	05/12/95	administrative charge	adm	1.	\$90.00
--3274A	05/16/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.3	\$27.00
--3274A	05/17/95	Review Plans/Reports	BC	1.	\$90.00
--3274A	05/19/95	Write Letters	BC	2.5	\$225.00
--3274A	05/22/95	Write Letters	BC	1.	\$90.00
--3274A	05/23/95	Investigation in Office	BC	0.3	\$27.00
--3274A	05/24/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	1.5	\$135.00
--3274A	05/24/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	1.8	\$162.00
--3274A	05/25/95	Write Letters	BC	1.	\$90.00
--3274A	05/26/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.3	\$27.00
--3274A	06/08/95	Review Plans/Reports	BC	1.	\$90.00

**ALAMEDA COUNTY ENVIRONMENTAL HEALTH SERVICES
UNDERGROUND TANK LISTING**

As of December 15, 1998

- 4 -

Xtra Oil Co. DBA Shell Oil 3495 Castro Valley Blvd. Castro Valley, CA 94701	Xtra Oil Co. Facility Phone: 537-7045	Certified
Castro Valley Chevron 3519 Castro Valley Blvd. Castro Valley, CA 94546	Azim Sakoori Facility Phone: 889-0579	Not Certified
ARCO Station #02152 22151 Center St. Castro Valley, CA 94546	ARCO Products Company	Certified
Kevin Hinkley Auto Tech 5269 Crow Canyon Road Castro Valley, CA 94552	Kevin Hinkley Facility Phone: 881-1052	Haz Substance
Quik Stop Market #84 2881 Grove Way Castro Valley, CA 94546	Quik Stop Markets, Inc. Facility Phone: 886-1710	Not Certified
Chevron #93283 3005 Grove Way Castro Valley, CA 94546	Chevron Jack Edwards Facility Phone: 581-6610	Certified
Tosco Corporation Site #2 3020 Grove Way Castro Valley, 94546	Tosco Linda Mui 581-9572	Certified
South County Corporation 17930 Lake Chabot Rd. Castro Valley, CA 94546	East Bay Regional Park District Facility Phone: 881-1833	Not Certified
Sunny's 76 #5484 18950 Lake Chabot Rd. Castro Valley, CA 94546	Tosco Igbal Chohan Facility Phone: 581-9572	Not Certified
Eden Hospital Medical Center 20103 Lake Chabot Rd. Castro Valley, CA 94546	Eden Hospital Medical Center Facility Phone: 889-5059	Certified
Quik Stop Market #88 20757 Lake Chabot Road Castro Valley, CA 94546	Quik Stop Markets, Inc. 601 Facility Phone: 537-9479	Not Certified

** WORKLOG HISTORY **

--3274A	06/19/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.4	\$36.00
--3274A	06/22/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.2	\$18.00
--3274A	06/23/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.8	\$72.00
--3274A	06/26/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.2	\$18.00
--3274A	07/05/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.3	\$27.00
--3274A	07/06/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.2	\$18.00
--3274A	07/13/95	Investigation On-Site	BC	1.	\$90.00
--3274A	07/18/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	1.1	\$99.00
--3274A	07/19/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.4	\$36.00
--3274A	07/20/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.4	\$36.00
--3274A	07/26/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	2.5	\$225.00
--3274A	07/28/95	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.5	\$45.00
--3274A	07/28/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.3	\$27.00
--3274A	07/31/95	Review Plans/Reports	BC	2.	\$180.00
--3274A	08/01/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.3	\$27.00
--3274A	08/15/95	Site Complaint	BC	0.3	\$27.00
--3274A	08/16/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.2	\$18.00
--3274A	08/17/95	Site Complaint	BC	0.1	\$9.00
--3274A	09/05/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.1	\$9.00
--3274A	09/14/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	1.	\$90.00
--3274A	09/19/95	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.7	\$63.00
--3274A	09/20/95	Review Plans/Reports	BC	2.	\$180.00
--3274A	09/28/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.4	\$36.00
--3274A	09/28/95	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.3	\$27.00
--3274A	09/29/95	Write Letters	BC	1.	\$90.00
--3274A	10/10/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.3	\$27.00
--3274A	10/17/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.4	\$36.00

ALAMEDA COUNTY ENVIRONMENTAL HEALTH SERVICES UNDERGROUND TANK LISTING

As of December 15, 1998

- 5 -

Pacific Bell 2610 Norbridge Avenue Castro Valley, CA 94546	Pacific Bell Facility Phone: 888-6027	Certified
Alameda County Fire Department 20336 San Miguel Ave. Castro Valley, CA 94546	Alameda County Fire Department 2307 Facility Phone: 670-5884	Not Certified
Stop 'N Save #18 20570 Stanton Ave. Castro Valley, CA 94546	Stop 'N Save, Inc. Facility Phone: 538-5713	Not Certified
Alameda County Fire Department 6901 Villa Real Drive Castro Valley, CA 94546	Alameda County Fire Department Facility Phone: 670-5887	Not Certified
Federal Correctional Institution 5701 8 th Street Camp Parks Dublin, CA 94568	Department of Justice Mike Goldstein Facility Phone: 833-7500	Certified
Amador Valley Exxon 7840 Amador Valley Blvd. Dublin, CA 94568	Exxon Facility Phone: 829-7218	Certified
Simon Mui UNOCAL #7176 7850 Amador Valley Blvd. Dublin, CA 94568	Tosco Facility Phone: 828-8352	Certified
Alameda County O.E.S. 4985 Broder Blvd. Dublin, CA 94546	County of Alameda, GSA Facility Phone: 551-6578	Certified
Santa Rita Jail 5325 Broder Blvd. Dublin, CA 94546	County of Alameda, GSA Facility Phone: 551-6674	Certified
Dublin Civic Center 100 Civic Plaza Dublin, CA 94568	City of Dublin Public Works Facility Phone: 833-6630	Certified
American Stores Company Data 6300 Clark Avenue Dublin, CA 94568	Kent McDonald Facility Phone: 829-0101	Certified

** WORKLOG HISTORY **

--3274A	10/26/95	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.5	\$45.00
--3274A	10/26/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.3	\$27.00
--3274A	10/27/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.1	\$9.00
--3274A	11/14/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.3	\$27.00
--3274A	11/17/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.4	\$36.00
--3274A	11/20/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.4	\$36.00
--3274A	11/21/95	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.5	\$45.00
--3274A	12/04/95	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.3	\$27.00
--3274A	12/08/95	Plan Review:Install/Mod/Remd or Mtg	BC	0.2	\$18.00
--3274A	01/10/96	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.2	\$18.00
--3274A	01/11/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.4	\$36.00
--3274A	01/16/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.1	\$9.00
--3274A	01/19/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.5	\$45.00
--3274A	01/26/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.4	\$36.00
--3274A	01/29/96	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.1	\$9.00
--3274A	02/06/96	District Attorney Time	BC	0.3	\$27.00
--3274A	02/08/96	Write Letters	BC	1.	\$90.00
--3274A	02/08/96	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.4	\$36.00
--3274A	02/13/96	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.2	\$18.00
--3274A	02/13/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.5	\$45.00
--3274A	02/20/96	Investigation On-Site	BC	0.5	\$45.00
--3274A	02/20/96	District Attorney Time	BC	0.2	\$18.00
--3274A	02/22/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.5	\$45.00
--3274A	02/23/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.2	\$18.00
--3274A	02/26/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.5	\$45.00
--3274A	02/28/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.3	\$27.00

**ALAMEDA COUNTY ENVIRONMENTAL HEALTH SERVICES
UNDERGROUND TANK LISTING**

As of December 15, 1998

- 6 -

Dougherty Road Shell 5933 Dougherty Rd. Dublin, CA 94568	Equilon LLC Facility Phone: 829-0101	Certified
Amador Automotive Center 6000 Dougherty Rd. Dublin, CA 94568	Property Resources, Inc. Facility Phone: 829-9300	Haz Substance
Tosco Corporation #261112 6400 Dublin Blvd. Dublin, CA 94568	Tosco Facility Phone: 828-1830	Not Certified
Circle K Stores, Inc. 6401 Dublin Blvd. Dublin, CA 94568	Tosco Facility Phone: 556-6790	Certified
Dublin Auto Wash 7240 Dublin Blvd. Dublin, CA 94568	Hooshang Hadjian 7240 Facility Phone: 828-2765	Certified
Crown Chevrolet, Inc. 7544 Dublin Blvd. Dublin, CA 94568	Pat Costello Facility Phone: 828-6500	Not Certified
Dublin Shell Foodmart 11989 Dublin Blvd. Dublin, CA 94568	Equilon LLC Facility Phone: 828-2770	Certified
GTE Mobilnet 10001 Dublin Canyon Rd. Dublin, CA 94568	GTE Wireless Facility Phone: 426-4592	Certified
Bay Counties Petroleum 6310 Houston Place Dublin, CA 94568	Winning Action Jeff Pitcock Facility Phone:	Not Certified
Heavy Equipment Repair Blvd. 6089 Madigan Rd. Dublin, CA 94568	Alameda County Public Works Facility Phone: 803-7000	Haz Substance
Santa Rita Fueling Station 6175 Madigan Road Dublin, CA 94546	County of Alameda, GSA Facility Phone: 828-9043	Certified

** WORKLOG HISTORY **

--3274A	03/12/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.8	\$72.00
--3274A	03/12/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.3	\$27.00
--3274A	03/13/96	Tank Removal	BC	0.5	\$45.00
--3274A	03/13/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.6	\$54.00
--3274A	03/13/96	Plan Review:Install/Mod/Remd or Mtg	BC	0.3	\$27.00
--3274A	03/15/96	Plan Review:Install/Mod/Remd or Mtg	BC	0.4	\$36.00
--3274A	03/20/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.2	\$18.00
--3274A	03/25/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.2	\$18.00
--3274A	03/26/96	Plan Review:Install/Mod/Remd or Mtg	BC	0.2	\$18.00
--3274A	03/27/96	Tank Removal	BC	0.5	\$45.00
--3274A	03/29/96	Plan Review:Install/Mod/Remd or Mtg	BC	0.2	\$18.00
--3274A	04/02/96	Plan Review:Install/Mod/Remd or Mtg	BC	0.3	\$27.00
--3274A	04/03/96	Tank Removal	BC	2.5	\$225.00
--3274A	04/03/96	Plan Review:Install/Mod/Remd or Mtg	BC	0.3	\$27.00
--3274A	04/04/96	Removal Investigation/Follow-up	BC	0.3	\$27.00
--3274A	04/04/96	Tank Removal	BC	2.	\$180.00
--3274A	04/15/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.5	\$45.00
--3274A	04/25/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.6	\$54.00
--3274A	04/26/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.4	\$36.00
--3274A	04/30/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.4	\$36.00
--3274A	04/30/96	Investigation On-Site	BC	0.3	\$27.00

**ALAMEDA COUNTY ENVIRONMENTAL HEALTH SERVICES
UNDERGROUND TANK LISTING**

As of December 15, 1998

- 7 -

Chevron Station #95542 7007 San Ramon Road Dublin, CA 94568	Chevron Facility Phone: 925-828-3935	Certified
Alcosta Shell #204-2277-0 8999 San Ramon Road Dublin, CA 94568	Equilon LLC Facility Phone: 828-4820	Certified
Corwood Car Wash 6973 Village Parkway Dublin, CA 94568	Mr. Woodward Facility Phone: 828-5151	Not Certified
Ron's AM/PM 7249 Village Pkwy Dublin, CA 94568	ARCO Products Company Facility Phone: 828-3163	Not Certified
AC Transit – Emeryville D 1177 47 th St. Emeryville, CA 94608	AC Transit District Facility Phone: 620-4928	Not Certified
Federal Express 1600 63 rd St. Emeryville, CA 94608	Federal Express Corporation 1120 Facility Phone: 547-8503	Not Certified
Amador Automotive Center 6000 Dougherty Road Dublin, CA 94568	Property Resources, Inc. Dan Stuber Facility Phone: 829-9300	Haz Substance
Emeryville Chevron 1400 Powell St. Emeryville, CA 94608	Ravan Facility Phone: 653-2251	Not Certified
Tosco Corporation Site #1 1700 Powell Street Emeryville, CA 94608	Tosco Shahram Azimi Facility Phone: 655-0909	Not Certified
Bay Super Shell #204-2495 1800 Powell St. Emeryville, CA 94608	Equilon Billy Hayes Facility Phone: 653-1800	Not Certified
Emeryville Sport Fishing 3310 Powell St. Emeryville, CA 94608	Hank Shramm Facility Phone: 654-6040	Not Certified

** WORKLOG HISTORY **

--3274A	05/01/96	Removal Investigation/Follow-up	BC	2.2	\$198.00
--3274A	05/02/96	Removal Investigation/Follow-up	BC	0.2	\$18.00
--3274A	05/02/96	Removal Investigation/Follow-up	BC	1.3	\$117.00
--3274A	05/06/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.5	\$45.00
--3274A	05/09/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.5	\$45.00
--3274A	05/10/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.3	\$27.00
--3274A	05/14/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.2	\$18.00
--3274A	05/20/96	Review Plans/Reports	BC	1.8	\$162.00
--3274A	05/20/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.2	\$18.00
--3274A	05/23/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.3	\$27.00
--3274A	05/24/96	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.4	\$36.00
--3274A	05/31/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.5	\$45.00
--3274A	07/01/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.3	\$28.20
--3274A	07/09/96	Write Letters	BC	1.5	\$141.00
--3274A	07/11/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.3	\$28.20
--3274A	07/18/96	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.3	\$28.20
--3274A	07/25/96	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.1	\$9.40
--3274A	08/13/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.3	\$28.20
--3274A	08/19/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.2	\$18.80
--3274A	08/21/96	Review Plans/Reports	BC	1.3	\$122.20
--3274A	08/21/96	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.3	\$28.20
--3274A	08/22/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.5	\$47.00
--3274A	08/23/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.2	\$18.80
--3274A	08/28/96	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.1	\$9.40
--3274A	08/30/96	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.2	\$18.80
--3274A	09/06/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	2.3	\$216.20

**ALAMEDA COUNTY ENVIRONMENTAL HEALTH SERVICES
UNDERGROUND TANK LISTING**

As of December 15, 1998

- 9 -

LLNL – 490 R3 U1 & U1 7000 East Avenue Livermore, CA 94550	DOE Facility Phone:	Haz Substance
LLNL – 152 D1 U2 7000 East Ave. Livermore, CA 94550	DOE Facility Phone:	Certified
LLNL – 113 D1 U2 7000 East Ave. Livermore, CA 94550	DOE Facility Phone:	Certified
LLNL – 332 R1 U1 & R1 7000 East Ave. Livermore, CA 94550	DOE Facility Phone:	Haz Substance
Sandia National Laboratory 7011 East Ave. Livermore, CA 94550	US Department of Energy Facility Phone: 422-2384	Not Certified
Piedmont Chevron 340 Highland Ave. Piedmont, CA 94611	Mir Ghafari/Fred Manouche Facility Phone: 547-2483	Not Certified
City of Piedmont Maintenance 898 Red Rock Rd. Piedmont, CA 94611	Mark Frazier Facility Phone: 420-3066	Not Certified
City of Piedmont 120 Vista Ave. Piedmont, CA 94611	Mark Feldcamp Facility Phone: 420-3064	Not Certified
Piedmont Shell #204-6001 29 Wildwood Ave. Piedmont, CA 94610	Equilon LLC Facility Phone: 654-0512	Certified
Calmat Company 50 El Charro Rd. Pleasanton, CA 94566	Calmat Corporation Facility Phone: 846-2852	Not Certified
Reliable Trucking, Inc. 51 El Charro Rd. Pleasanton, CA 94566	Reliable Trucking, Inc. Facility Phone: 449-8334	Certified

** WORKLOG HISTORY **

--3274A	09/06/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.3	\$28.20
--3274A	09/10/96	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.4	\$37.60
--3274A	09/10/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.2	\$18.80
--3274A	09/13/96	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.5	\$47.00
--3274A	09/16/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	3.5	\$329.00
--3274A	09/17/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.2	\$18.80
--3274A	09/19/96	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.2	\$18.80
--3274A	09/20/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	2.3	\$216.20
--3274A	09/23/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.5	\$47.00
--3274A	09/23/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.3	\$28.20
--3274A	09/30/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	2.	\$188.00
--3274A	11/27/96	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.3	\$28.20
--3274A	12/06/96	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.3	\$28.20
--3274A	02/05/97	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.8	\$75.20
--3274A	02/06/97	Write Letters	BC	1.	\$94.00
--3274A	02/11/97	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.4	\$37.60
--3274A	02/13/97	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.1	\$9.40
--3274A	02/18/97	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.4	\$37.60
--3274A	04/09/97	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.3	\$28.20
--3274A	06/19/97	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.9	\$84.60
--3274A	07/22/97	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.5	\$47.00
--3274A	05/13/98	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.3	\$28.20
--3274A	05/18/98	Review Plans/Reports	BC	2.5	\$235.00
--3274A	05/26/98	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.5	\$47.00
--3274A	05/27/98	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.3	\$28.20
--3274A	06/22/98	Meetings, Consultations	SH	0.4	\$37.60
--3274A	07/07/98	Meetings, Consultations	SH	0.5	\$50.00

Total Chgs \$ 9252.45
 page 6

balance <-6,054.45>

**ALAMEDA COUNTY ENVIRONMENTAL HEALTH SERVICES
UNDERGROUND TANK LISTING**

As of December 15, 1998

- 11 -

Freedom ARCO Mini Mart 164446 Ashland Ave. San Lorenzo, CA 94580	M. Pazel Facility Phone:	Not Certified
GearWorks 3310 Powell St. Emeryville, CA 94608	Richard Taylor Facility Phone: 278-5213	Not Certified
Organizational Maintenance Shop 16501 Ashland Ave. San Lorenzo, CA 94580	State Military Department Facility Phone: 278-4353	Not Certified
Impulse Motor and Gas 1210 Bockman Rd. San Lorenzo, CA 94580	Pollard Ventures Facility Phone: 481-1965	Not Certified
East Bay Dischargers Authority 2651 Grant Avenue San Lorenzo, CA 94580	East Bay Dischargers Authority Facility Phone: 278-5910	Certified
Chevron #90504 15900 Hesperian Blvd. San Lorenzo, CA 94580	Chevron Facility Phone: 278-4392	Certified
ARCO Station #608 17601 Hesperian Blvd. San Lorenzo, CA 94580	ARCO Products Co. Facility Phone: 278-2977	Certified
Hutch's Car Wash 17945 Hesperian Blvd. San Lorenzo, CA 94580	Hutch's Car Wash Facility Phone: 278-1010	Not Certified
Tosco #11107 18501 Hesperian Blvd. San Lorenzo, CA 94580	Tosco, Co. Facility Phone: 481-1254	Certified

** WORKLOG HISTORY **

\$9,252.45

Balance: -\$6,064.45 Amount Refunded:

=====

Proj#	Work Date	Activity Description	Insp	Time (hrs)	Amount Charged
-----	-----	-----	----	-----	-----
--3274B	01/29/96	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.4	\$36.00
--3274B	02/21/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.5	\$45.00
--3274B	03/08/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.1	\$9.00
--3274B	03/18/96	Investigation in Office	BC	3.	\$270.00
--3274B	09/06/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.4	\$37.60
--3274B	09/11/96	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.4	\$37.60
--3274B	12/18/96	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.1	\$9.40
--3274B	03/17/97	Investigation in Office	BC	1.	\$94.00
--3274B	04/23/97	Write Letters	BC	0.5	\$47.00
--3274b	04/29/97	administrative charge	adm	1.	\$94.00
--3274B	04/29/97	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.4	\$37.60
--3274B	04/29/97	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.2	\$18.80
--3274B	04/30/97	Write Letters	BC	0.5	\$47.00
--3274B	05/02/97	Write Letters	BC	0.5	\$47.00
--3274B	05/02/97	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.4	\$37.60
--3274B	05/06/97	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.7	\$65.80
--3274B	11/24/97	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.9	\$84.60
--3274B	11/26/97	Review Plans/Reports	BC	1.	\$94.00
--3274B	12/01/97	Review Plans/Reports	BC	1.4	\$131.60
--3274B	12/01/97	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.5	\$47.00
--3274B	12/03/97	Meetings, Consultations	BC	2.	\$188.00
--3274B	12/11/97	Meetings, Consultations	BC	2.5	\$235.00
--3274B	12/19/97	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.4	\$37.60

**ALAMEDA COUNTY ENVIRONMENTAL HEALTH SERVICES
UNDERGROUND TANK LISTING**

As of December 15, 1998

- 12 -

Beacon Station #721 44 Lewelling Blvd. San Lorenzo, CA 94580	Ultramar, Inc. Facility Phone: 481-1254	Certified
UNOCAL 76 376 Lewelling Blvd. San Lorenzo, CA 94580	Tosco Facility Phone: 481-9260	Not Certified
EBMUD, So. Area Service C 589 E. Lewelling Blvd. San Lorenzo, CA 94580	EBMUD Facility Phone: 287-0837	Certified
Engine Research Company 610 E. Lewelling Blvd. San Lorenzo, CA 94580	Rick Gold Facility Phone: 276-9334	Not Certified
San Lorenzo School District 15510 Usher St. San Lorenzo, CA 94580	San Lorenzo Unified School District Facility Phone: 317-4644	Certified
Cal Gas 15595 Washington Ave. San Lorenzo, CA 94580	Mehdi Mohammadian Facility Phone: 276-0522	Not Certified
DiSalvo Trucking 15651 Worthley Dr. San Lorenzo, CA 94580	DiSalvo Trucking Co. Facility Phone: 481-2200	Certified
Sunol Tree Gasoline 3004 Andrade Rd. Sunol, CA 94586	Murray Kelso Facility Phone: 862-2288	Not Certified
Alameda Operations and Maintenance 505 Paloma Way Sunol, CA 94586	City & County of San Francisco 1155 Facility Phone: 862-2233	Certified
Stratos Mobile Networks 38000 Palomares Rd. Sunol, CA 94586	Stratos Mobile Networks Facility Phone: 505-1820	Certified

** WORKLOG HISTORY **

--3274B	01/06/98	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.3	\$28.20
--3274B	01/07/98	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.3	\$28.20
--3274B	01/14/98	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.1	\$9.40
--3274B	06/05/98	Meetings, Consultations	BC	2.	\$188.00
--3274B	06/22/98	Meetings, Consultations	BC	1.5	\$141.00
--3274B	06/23/98	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.5	\$47.00
--3274B	07/08/98	Review Plans/Reports	BC	1.5	\$150.00
--3274B	07/09/98	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.5	\$50.00
--3274B	07/23/98	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.4	\$40.00
--3274B	08/06/98	Review Plans/Reports	BC	1.	\$100.00
--3274B	08/10/98	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.3	\$30.00
--3274B	08/11/98	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.5	\$50.00
--3274B	08/11/98	Meetings, Consultations	BC	0.5	\$50.00
--3274B	08/20/98	Review Plans/Reports	BC	0.3	\$30.00

					\$2,693.00

Balance: \$4,307.00 Amount Refunded:

=====

ALAMEDA COUNTY - DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL HEALTH - MEMORANDUM

DATE : 07/20/95
TO : Mildred Papa, Special Billing Unit
FROM : Melanie Killian, ^{mk} Hazardous Materials Specialist
SUBJECT: NEW BILLING - AB2185 PROGRAM

Please find enclosed the listing of new businesses identified for the HMBP (Hazardous Mat'ls Business Plan, aka AB-2185) billing.

SUMMARY

=====

new establishments : 6
estimated additional revenue: \$1,156.39

Also find the enclosed support documents:
- Monthly listing of existing Business Plan accounts
- file labels for all new accounts

Kindly process for billing.

Thank you for your assistance.

S 1
E 3
C 1
N 1

cc: Rafat Shahid, Asst. Agency Director, DEH
Candyce Kelly, Billing Supervisor
Acting Chief of Environmental Protection Division