

ALAMEDA COUNTY HAZARDOUS MATERIALS DIVISION  
DEPOSIT / REFUND ACCOUNT SHEET

printed 06/23/97

SITE INFORMATION

Hardchrome/ Anderson  
750 107th Ave  
Oakland 94603  
Site Contact:  
Site Phone :

StID: 1364 Site#: 2174  
PROJECT#: 2174A  
PROJECT TYPE: \*\*\* M \*\*\*  
INSP: Madhulla Logan  
ACCT. SHEET PG #: \_\_\_\_\_

PROPERTY OWNER INFORMATION

Owner Contact:  
Owner Phone :

PAYOR INFORMATION

D. M. Mc Lemore Trust  
147 E. Liberty St.  
Reno NV 89501 # 723  
Payor Contact: Cheryl Plato Mclemor  
Payor Phone :

| Date    | Action Taken   | Insp<br>Init | Hours<br>Spent/<br>Depstd | Hour<br>Balnce | Money<br>Spent/<br>Depositd | Money<br>Balance |
|---------|--|--------------|---------------------------|----------------|-----------------------------|------------------|
|         | Rcpt# 668974   |              |                           |                |                             | 163.50           |
|         | Balance from Prev. Page  |              |                           |                |                             |                  |
|         | <i>See attached yellow highlighted debits not previously debited</i> |              |                           |                |                             |                  |
| 3/23/93 |  |              | 1.0                       | 75/hr          | 75                          | 88.50            |
| 3/25/93 |  |              | 0.25                      |                | 18.75                       | 69.75            |
| 4/28/93 |  |              | 1.0                       |                | 75                          | -5.25            |
| 5/4/93  |  |              | 1.0                       |                | 75                          | 80.25            |
| 5/4/93  |  |              | 1.0                       |                | 75                          | -155.25          |
| 5/4/93  |  |              | 2.0                       |                | 150.                        | -305.25          |
| 6/11/93 |  |              | 0.5                       |                | 37.50                       | -342.75          |
| 9/21/93 |  |              | 0.5                       |                | 37.50                       | -380.25          |
| 9/21/93 |  |              | 0.25                      |                | 18.75                       | -399.-           |

UPON COMPLETION OF PROJECT

PROJ COMPLETED BY : \_\_\_\_\_ ATTACH:  State Forms A, B & C  
 Billing Adjustment\*  
DATE OF COMPLETION : \_\_\_\_\_ DATE SENT TO BILLING: \_\_\_\_\_  
TOTAL COST OF PROJECT: \_\_\_\_\_ REFUND AMOUNT: \_\_\_\_\_ Rev. 7/96

\* Billing adjustment forms needed when site is in our UST program.

Listing of HAZMAT - FULL SITE HISTORY since 1987 for StID # 1364  
as of 06/23/97 .... all Activity Codes

SITE NAME & ADDRESS:

Hard Chrome Engineering -- 750 107th Ave , Oakland CA 94603

InspDat Insp Act InspT StID Proj# COMMENTS DailBDat  
=====

Archived Dailies:

| InspDat  | Insp | Activi | Categ | InspT | StID  |   |          |
|----------|------|--------|-------|-------|-------|---|----------|
| 03/03/87 | lm   | F      | 1     | 4.    | 1364  |   |          |
| 02/09/88 | AL   | A      | 1     | 1.    | 1364  |   |          |
| 01/17/90 | AL   | I      | 13    | 5.    | 1364  |   |          |
| 01/20/93 | LS   | 20     | 2.    | 1364  |       | Waste min. audit  |          |
| 03/23/93 | LS   | 74     | 1.    | 1364  | 2174A |   | 06/05/97 |
| 03/25/93 | LS   | 74     | 0.25  | 1364  | 2174A |   | 06/05/97 |
| 04/28/93 | RO   | 75     | 1.    | 1364  | 2174A | Site mit. file review                                   | 06/05/97 |
| 05/04/93 | LS   | 75     | 1.5   | 1364  | 2174A |   | 01/01/90 |
| 05/04/93 | RO   | 75     | 1.    | 1364  | 2174A | Site mit. file review                                   | 06/05/97 |
| 05/04/93 | LS   | 77     | 2.    | 1364  | 2174A | Meeting with property owners<br>consultant and attorney | 01/01/90 |
| 05/04/93 | RO   | 77     | 1.    | 1364  | 2174A | Site mit. meeting summary                               | 06/05/97 |
| 05/04/93 | RO   | 77     | 2.    | 1364  | 2174A | Site mit. meeting w/LS & others                         | 06/05/97 |
| 05/04/93 | RO   | 78     | 1.    | 1364  |       | Site mit. training w/LS                                 |          |
| 05/20/93 | LS   | 11     | 1.    | 1364  |       |   |          |
| 05/20/93 | RO   | 11     | 1.    | 1364  |       | Generator inspection w/LS                               |          |
| 05/20/93 | RO   | 50     | 1.    | 1364  |       | New HMMP inspection w/LS                                |          |
| 05/20/93 | LS   | 51     | 1.    | 1364  |       |   |          |
| 05/20/93 | LS   | 111    | 0.5   | 1364  |       |   |          |
| 05/20/93 | RO   | 111    | 0.5   | 1364  |       | 60 day overdue list inspection<br>w/LS                  |          |
| 06/10/93 | LS   | 75     | 1.    | 1364  | 2174A |   | 06/05/97 |
| 06/11/93 | LS   | 74     | 1.5   | 1364  | 2174A |   | 01/01/90 |
| 06/11/93 | RO   | 78     | 1.    | 1364  |       | Site mit. training w/LS                                 |          |
| 08/05/93 | LS   | 77     | 0.5   | 1364  | 2174A |   | 01/01/90 |
| 08/11/93 | BO   | 75     | 0.5   | 1364  | 2174A | review of file, work plan                               | 06/05/97 |
| 09/10/93 | LS   | 75     | 0.75  | 1364  | 2174A |   | 01/01/90 |
| 09/21/93 | BO   | 75     | 0.5   | 1364  | 2174A | case/file review  | 06/05/97 |
| 09/21/93 | BO   | 77     | 0.25  | 1364  | 2174A | on phone to lawyers                                     | 06/05/97 |
| 11/02/93 | BO   | 83     | 1.    | 1364  |       |   |          |
| 11/11/93 | BO   | 75     | 2.    | 1364  | 2174A | review of reports on phone to<br>attorneys              | 06/05/97 |
| 11/16/93 | BO   | 83     | 1.    | 1364  |       | site search   |          |
| 12/16/93 | ML   | 75     | 1.    | 1364  | 2174A | workplan review add 0.5                                 | 06/05/97 |
| 04/05/94 | RO   | 51     | 1.    | 1364  |       | HMBP inspection   |          |
| 04/05/94 | RO   | 120    | 2.    | 1364  |       | NPDES inspection  |          |

Current Dailies:

NO WORK FOR THIS SITE IS IN CURRENT DAILIES:

LEGEND FOR 'OLD' DAILY ENTRIES

Category: ( Program )

O - Office  
L - Legal

I - regular Inspection  
F - Follow up inspection

Activity:

1 - Generators  
2 - UG Tanks

ALAMEDA COUNTY ENVIRONMENTAL HEALTH - HAZARDOUS MATERIALS PROGRAM  
INFORMATION PER SITE ON ALL DEPOSITS FROM ALL PAYORS

as of 06/23/97

DATABASE: DEPREF

===== SITE INFORMATION from DepRef DB =====

Hardchrome/ Anderson  
750 107th Ave  
Oakland CA 94603

StID: 1364 Site#: 2174  
Site Complete?

===== ALL PAYORS ON SITE =====

> Project# 2174A for Payor# 723 D. M. Mc Lemore Trust  
147 E. Liberty St.  
Reno NV 89501

DR: WkShtPay

===== DEPOSIT INFORMATION =====

| Project#                   | Rcpt#  | DepDate  | DepAmount  | Proj Type | Deposit Complete | Insp Init | Collect Fees? |
|----------------------------|--------|----------|------------|-----------|------------------|-----------|---------------|
| 2174A                      | <----- |          |            |           |                  |           |               |
|                            | 668974 | 04/07/93 | \$951.00   | M         |                  | ML        |               |
|                            | 795740 | 06/17/97 | \$1,500.00 | A         |                  | ML        |               |
| Total Deposit for Project: |        |          | \$2,451.00 |           |                  |           |               |
| -----                      |        |          |            |           |                  |           |               |
| Total Deps for all Sites : |        |          | \$2,451.00 |           |                  |           |               |

Report WkShtDep Complete; 3/97

LAST WORK DATE FROM BILLING ON THIS SITE:

1364 --2174?  
0

## ALAMEDA COUNTY HAZARDOUS MATERIALS DIVISION

06/23/97

|                                       |
|---------------------------------------|
| UNDERGROUND STORAGE TANK CLEANUP SITE |
|---------------------------------------|

|                                |                    |                 |
|--------------------------------|--------------------|-----------------|
| AGENCY#: 10000                 | SOURCE OF FUNDS: - | INSPECTOR: ML   |
| StID: 1364                     | SUBSTANCE: -       |                 |
| SITE NAME: Hardchrome/Anderson |                    | DATE REPORTED : |
| ADDRESS : 750 107th Ave        |                    | DATE CONFIRMED: |
| CITY/ZIP : Oakland, CA 94603   |                    | MULTIPLE RP's : |

|            |                  |        |                     |
|------------|------------------|--------|---------------------|
| CASE TYPE: | CONTRACT STATUS: | PRIOR: | EMERGENCY RESPONSE: |
|------------|------------------|--------|---------------------|

|                     |             |           |
|---------------------|-------------|-----------|
| RP SEARCH :         |             | DATE END: |
| PRELIM ASSESSMENT : | DATE BEGIN: | DATE END: |
| REMEDIAL INVESTIG : | DATE BEGIN: | DATE END: |
| REMEDIAL ACTION :   | DATE BEGIN: | DATE END: |
| POST REMED MONITOR: | DATE BEGIN: | DATE END: |

|                                |                         |
|--------------------------------|-------------------------|
| TYPE ENFORCEMENT ACTION TAKEN: | DATE OF ENFORC. ACTION: |
|--------------------------------|-------------------------|

|   |
|---|
| UNDERGROUND STORAGE TANK CLEANUP SITE - SCREEN #2 |
|---|

|                                  |                  |
|----------------------------------|------------------|
| LUFT FIELD MANUAL CONSIDERATION: | CASE CLOSED: on: |
|----------------------------------|------------------|

|               |                         |
|---------------|-------------------------|
| DT EXC START: | REMEDIAL ACTIONS TAKEN: |
|---------------|-------------------------|

|                  |          |
|------------------|----------|
| RP #1: CONTACT:  | RP COST: |
| RP COMPANY NAME: | Ph:      |
| ADDRESS:         |          |
| CITY/STATE:      |          |

|          |
|----------|
| ※ 2MENT: |
|----------|

Listing all LOP DAILY activities since 1991 for StID # 1364  
as of 06/23/97

Hardchrome/Anderson at as of 06/23/97 , Oakland CA 94603

Act91\_4  
Act92\_1  
Act92\_2  
Act92\_3  
Act92\_4  
Act92\_5  
Act93\_1  
Act93\_2  
Act93\_3  
Act93\_4  
Act94\_1  
Act94\_2  
Act94\_3

\*\*\*\*\* Alameda County Department of Environmental Health \*\*\*\*\*  
 BILLING's WORKLOG: Total Deposit/Refund History for All Accounts at Site  
 ~~~~~

\*\* SITE INFORMATION \*\*

Site#: 2174 -- StID: 1364 HARDCHROME/ANDERSON  
 Date Open: 04/07/93 750 --107TH AVENUE  
 Date Closed: OAKLAND CA 94603

\*\* PAYOR INFORMATION \*\*

> Project # -2174A for Payor # 723 CHERYL PLATO MCLEMORE  
 147 E LIBERTY STREET  
 RENO NV 89501

\*\* DEPOSIT HISTORY \*\*

| Proj#  | Deposit Date | Receipt# | Amount Received |
|--------|--------------|----------|-----------------|
| -----  | -----        | -----    | -----           |
| -2174A | 04/07/93     | 668974   | \$ 951.00       |
|        |              |          | =====           |
|        |              |          | \$ 951.00       |

\*\* WORKLOG HISTORY \*\*

| Proj#    | Work Date | Activity Description     | Insp  | Time (hrs) | Amount Charged |
|----------|-----------|--------------------------|-------|------------|----------------|
| -----    | -----     | -----                    | ----- | -----      | -----          |
| -2174a ✓ | 05/04/93  | report review            |       | 1.5        | \$112.50       |
| -2174a ✓ | 05/04/93  | meet w/consultant        |       | 2.         | \$150.00       |
| -2174a ✓ | 06/11/93  | Letter                   |       | 1.5        | \$112.50       |
| -2174a ✓ | 08/05/93  | call w/consultant        |       | 0.5        | \$37.50        |
| -2174a ✓ | 09/10/93  | File Review              |       | 0.75       | \$56.25        |
| -2174a ✓ | 11/10/93  | report review/letter NID |       | 2.75       | \$206.25       |
| -2174a ✓ | 12/15/93  | report file review       |       | 1.5        | \$112.50       |
|          |           |                          |       |            | -----          |
|          |           |                          |       |            | \$787.50       |

Balance: \$163.50 Amount Refunded:

Listing of HAZMAT - FULL SITE HISTORY since 1987 for StID # 1364  
as of 07/25/2001 .... all Activity Codes

SITE NAME & ADDRESS:

Hard Chrome Engineering -- 750 107th Ave , Oakland CA 94603

InspDat Insp Act InspT StID Proj# COMMENTS DailBDat  
=====

Archived Dailies:

| InspDat    | Insp | Activi | Categ | InspT | StID  |                                                         | DailBDat |
|------------|------|--------|-------|-------|-------|---------------------------------------------------------|----------|
| 03/03/1987 | lm   | F      | 1     | 4.    | 1364  |                                                         |          |
| 02/09/1988 | AL   | A      | 1     | 1.    | 1364  |                                                         |          |
| 01/17/1990 | AL   | I      | 13    | 5.    | 1364  |                                                         |          |
| 01/20/1993 | LS   | 20     | 2.    | 1364  | -0-   | Waste min. audit                                        | -0-      |
| 03/23/1993 | LS   | 74     | 1.    | 1364  | 2174A | -0-                                                     | *****    |
| 03/25/1993 | LS   | 74     | 0.25  | 1364  | 2174A | -0-                                                     | *****    |
| 04/28/1993 | RO   | 75     | 1.    | 1364  | 2174A | Site mit. file review                                   | *****    |
| 05/04/1993 | LS   | 75     | 1.5   | 1364  | 2174A | -0-                                                     | *****    |
| 05/04/1993 | RO   | 75     | 1.    | 1364  | 2174A | Site mit. file review                                   | *****    |
| 05/04/1993 | LS   | 77     | 2.    | 1364  | 2174A | Meeting with property owners<br>consultant and attorney | *****    |
| 05/04/1993 | RO   | 77     | 1.    | 1364  | 2174A | Site mit. meeting summary                               | *****    |
| 05/04/1993 | RO   | 77     | 2.    | 1364  | 2174A | Site mit. meeting w/LS & others                         | *****    |
| 05/04/1993 | RO   | 78     | 1.    | 1364  | -0-   | Site mit. training w/LS                                 | -0-      |
| 05/20/1993 | LS   | 11     | 1.    | 1364  | -0-   | -0-                                                     | -0-      |
| 05/20/1993 | RO   | 11     | 1.    | 1364  | -0-   | Generator inspection w/LS                               | -0-      |
| 05/20/1993 | RO   | 50     | 1.    | 1364  | -0-   | New HMMP inspection w/LS                                | -0-      |
| 05/20/1993 | LS   | 51     | 1.    | 1364  | -0-   | -0-                                                     | -0-      |
| 05/20/1993 | LS   | 111    | 0.5   | 1364  | -0-   | -0-                                                     | -0-      |
| 05/20/1993 | RO   | 111    | 0.5   | 1364  | -0-   | 60 day overdue list inspection<br>w/LS                  | -0-      |
| 06/10/1993 | LS   | 75     | 1.    | 1364  | 2174A | -0-                                                     | *****    |
| 06/11/1993 | LS   | 74     | 1.5   | 1364  | 2174A | -0-                                                     | *****    |
| 06/11/1993 | RO   | 78     | 1.    | 1364  | -0-   | Site mit. training w/LS                                 | -0-      |
| 08/05/1993 | LS   | 77     | 0.5   | 1364  | 2174A | -0-                                                     | *****    |
| 08/11/1993 | BO   | 75     | 0.5   | 1364  | 2174A | review of file, work plan                               | *****    |
| 09/10/1993 | LS   | 75     | 0.75  | 1364  | 2174A | -0-                                                     | *****    |
| 09/21/1993 | BO   | 75     | 0.5   | 1364  | 2174A | case/file review                                        | *****    |
| 09/21/1993 | BO   | 77     | 0.25  | 1364  | 2174A | on phone to lawyers                                     | *****    |
| 11/02/1993 | BO   | 83     | 1.    | 1364  | -0-   | -0-                                                     | -0-      |
| 11/11/1993 | BO   | 75     | 2.    | 1364  | 2174A | review of reports on phone to<br>attorneys              | *****    |
| 11/16/1993 | BO   | 83     | 1.    | 1364  | -0-   | site search                                             | -0-      |
| 12/16/1993 | ML   | 75     | 1.    | 1364  | 2174A | workplan review                                         | *****    |
| 04/05/1994 | RO   | 51     | 1.    | 1364  | -0-   | HMBP inspection                                         | -0-      |
| 04/05/1994 | RO   | 120    | 2.    | 1364  | -0-   | NPDES inspection                                        | -0-      |

Current Dailies:

| InspDat    | Insp | Act | InspT | StID | DRPro | Comment                                           | DailBDat |
|------------|------|-----|-------|------|-------|---------------------------------------------------|----------|
| 05/09/1997 | ML   | 75  | 2.    | 1364 | 2174A | review                                            | *****    |
| 05/14/1997 | ML   | 75  | 1.    | 1364 | 2174A | review                                            | *****    |
| 05/16/1997 | ML   | 75  | 4.    | 1364 | 2174A | review all documents,<br>documentation and letter | *****    |

Category: ( Program )

Activity:

- O - Office  
L - Legal  
P - Program  
T - Training  
A - Advice / consult.  
E - Environ. study
- I - regular Inspection  
F - Follow up inspection  
S - Spill / release  
Q - reQuest / complaint

- 1 - Generators  
2 - UG Tanks  
3 - Business Plans  
4 - Haz.Waste Hauler  
5 - Emerg. Resp.  
6 - Contam. Site  
7 - Public Lands  
8 - Residential

Valid for Dailies in 1987 --> 1989

Complete

ALAMEDA COUNTY ENVIRONMENTAL HEALTH - HAZARDOUS MATERIALS PROGRAM  
INFORMATION PER SITE ON ALL DEPOSITS FROM ALL PAYORS

as of 07/25/2001

DATABASE: DEPREF

=====  
SITE INFORMATION from DepRef DB  
=====

Hardchrome/ Anderson  
750 107th Ave  
Oakland CA 94603

StID: 1364 Site#: 2174  
Site Complete?

=====  
ALL PAYORS ON SITE  
=====

> Project# 2174A for Payor# 723 D. M. Mc Lomore Trust  
147 E. Liberty St.  
Reno NV 89501

DR:WkShtPay

=====  
DEPOSIT INFORMATION  
=====

| Project# | Rcpt#                      | DepDate    | DepAmount  | Proj Type | Deposit Complete | Insp Init | Collect Fees? |
|----------|----------------------------|------------|------------|-----------|------------------|-----------|---------------|
| 2174A    | <-----                     |            |            |           |                  |           |               |
|          | 668974                     | 04/07/1993 | \$951.00   | M         | 01/01/1990       | CL        |               |
|          | 795740                     | 06/17/1997 | \$1,500.00 | A         |                  | AG        |               |
|          | 805803                     | 05/19/1998 | \$699.00   | A         |                  | AG        |               |
|          | Total Deposit for Project: |            | \$3,150.00 |           |                  |           |               |
|          | -----                      |            |            |           |                  |           |               |
|          | Total Deps for all Sites : |            | \$3,150.00 |           |                  |           |               |

Report WkShtDep Complete; 6/99

LAST WORK DATE FROM BILLING ON THIS SITE:

1364



ALAMEDA COUNTY ENVIRONMENTAL HEALTH - HAZARDOUS MATERIALS PROGRAM  
INFORMATION PER SITE ON ALL DEPOSITS FROM ALL PAYORS

as of 04/17/97

DATABASE: DEPREF  
~~~~~

===== SITE INFORMATION from DepRef DB =====

Hardchrome/ Anderson  
750 107th Ave  
Oakland CA 94603

StID: 1364 Site#: 2174  
Site Complete?

===== ALL PAYORS ON SITE =====

> Project# 2174A for Payor# 723 Mc Lomore, Cheryl Plato  
147 E. Liberty St.  
Reno NV 89501

DR: WkShtPay

===== DEPOSIT INFORMATION =====

| Project#                            | Rcpt#            | DepDate  | DepAmount | Proj<br>Type | Deposit<br>Complete | Insp<br>Init | Collect<br>Fees? |
|-------------------------------------|------------------|----------|-----------|--------------|---------------------|--------------|------------------|
| 2174A                               | <-----<br>668974 | 04/07/93 | \$951.00  | M            |                     | ML           |                  |
| Total Deposit for Project:          |                  |          |           | \$951.00     |                     |              |                  |
| -----<br>Total Deps for all Sites : |                  |          |           | \$951.00     |                     |              |                  |

Report WkShtDep Complete; 3/97

LAST WORK DATE FROM BILLING ON THIS SITE: 01/01/87

Listing of Archived HAZMAT DAILY activities since 1987 for StID # 1364  
as of 04/17/97 . . . . all Activity Codes

SITE NAME & ADDRESS:

Hard Chrome Engineering -- 750 107th Ave , Oakland CA 94603

|         |      |     |       |      |       |          |          |
|---------|------|-----|-------|------|-------|----------|----------|
| InspDat | Insp | Act | InspT | StID | Proj# | COMMENTS | DailBDat |
| =====   | ==== | ==  | ===== | ==== | ===== | =====    | =====    |

Archived Dailies:

| InspDat  | Insp  | Activi | Categ | InspT | StID  |   |
|----------|-------|--------|-------|-------|-------|---|
| -----    | ----- | -----  | ----- | ----- | ----- |   |
| 03/03/87 | lm    | F      | 1     | 4.    | 1364  |   |
| 02/09/88 | AL    | A      | 1     | 1.    | 1364  |   |
| 01/17/90 | AL    | I      | 13    | 5.    | 1364  |   |
| 01/20/93 | LS    | 20     | 2.    | 1364  |       | Waste min. audit  |
| 03/23/93 | LS    | 74     | 1.    | 1364  | 2174A |   |
| 03/25/93 | LS    | 74     | 0.25  | 1364  | 2174A |   |
| 04/28/93 | RO    | 75     | 1.    | 1364  | 2174A | Site mit. file review                                   |
| 05/04/93 | LS    | 75     | 1.5   | 1364  | 2174A |   |
| 05/04/93 | RO    | 75     | 1.    | 1364  | 2174A | Site mit. file review                                   |
| 05/04/93 | LS    | 77     | 2.    | 1364  | 2174A | Meeting with property owners<br>consultant and attorney |
| 05/04/93 | RO    | 77     | 1.    | 1364  | 2174A | Site mit. meeting summary                               |
| 05/04/93 | RO    | 77     | 2.    | 1364  | 2174A | Site mit. meeting w/LS & others                         |
| 05/04/93 | RO    | 78     | 1.    | 1364  |       | Site mit. training w/LS                                 |
| 05/20/93 | LS    | 11     | 1.    | 1364  |       |   |
| 05/20/93 | RO    | 11     | 1.    | 1364  |       | Generator inspection w/LS                               |
| 05/20/93 | RO    | 50     | 1.    | 1364  |       | New HMMP inspection w/LS                                |
| 05/20/93 | LS    | 51     | 1.    | 1364  |       |   |
| 05/20/93 | LS    | 111    | 0.5   | 1364  |       |   |
| 05/20/93 | RO    | 111    | 0.5   | 1364  |       | 60 day overdue list inspection<br>w/LS                  |
| 06/10/93 | LS    | 75     | 1.    | 1364  | 2174A |   |
| 06/11/93 | LS    | 74     | 1.5   | 1364  | 2174A |   |
| 06/11/93 | RO    | 78     | 1.    | 1364  |       | Site mit. training w/LS                                 |
| 08/05/93 | LS    | 77     | 0.5   | 1364  | 2174A |   |
| 08/11/93 | BO    | 75     | 0.5   | 1364  | 2174A | review of file, work plan                               |
| 09/10/93 | LS    | 75     | 0.75  | 1364  | 2174A |   |
| 09/21/93 | BO    | 75     | 0.5   | 1364  | 2174A | case/file review  |
| 09/21/93 | BO    | 77     | 0.25  | 1364  | 2174A | on phone to lawyers                                     |
| 11/02/93 | BO    | 83     | 1.    | 1364  |       |   |
| 11/11/93 | BO    | 75     | 2.    | 1364  | 2174A | review of reports on phone to<br>attorneys              |
| 11/16/93 | BO    | 83     | 1.    | 1364  |       | site search   |
| 12/16/93 | ML    | 75     | 1.    | 1364  | 2174A | workplan review   |
| 04/05/94 | RO    | 51     | 1.    | 1364  |       | HMBP inspection   |
| 04/05/94 | RO    | 120    | 2.    | 1364  |       | NPDES inspection  |

Current Dailies:

NO WORK FOR THIS SITE IS IN CURRENT DAILIES:

=====

LEGEND FOR 'OLD' DAILY ENTRIES

Category: ( Program )

Activity:

O - Office  
L - Legal

I - regular Inspection  
F - Follow up inspection

1 - Generators  
2 - UG Tanks

\*\*\*\*\* Alameda County Department of Environmental Health \*\*\*\*\*  
BILLING's Total Deposit/Refund History for All Accounts at Site  
~~~~~

\*\* SITE INFORMATION \*\*

Site#: 2174 -- StID: 1364 HARDCHROME/ANDERSON  
Date Open: 04/07/93 750 --107TH AVENUE  
Date Closed: OAKLAND CA 94603

\*\* PAYOR INFORMATION \*\*

> Project # -2174A for Payor # 723 CHERYL PLATO MCLEMORE  
147 E LIBERTY STREET  
RENO NV 89501

\*\* DEPOSIT HISTORY \*\*

| Proj#  | Deposit Date | Receipt# | Amount Received |
|--------|--------------|----------|-----------------|
| -2174A | 04/07/93     | 668974   | \$ 951.00       |
|        |              |          | =====           |
|        |              |          | \$ 951.00       |

\*\* WORKLOG HISTORY \*\*

| Proj#  | Work Date | Activity Description | Insp | Time (hrs) | Amt Charged |
|--------|-----------|----------------------|------|------------|-------------|
| -2174a | 05/04/93  | report review ✓      |      | 1.5        | \$112.50    |
| -2174a | 05/04/93  | meet w/consultant ✓  |      | 2.         | \$150.00    |
| -2174a | 06/11/93  | Letter               |      | 1.5        | \$112.50    |
| -2174a | 08/05/93  | call w/consultant    |      | 0.5        | \$37.50     |
| -2174a | 09/10/93  | File Review          |      | 0.75       | \$56.25     |
| -2174a | 11/10/93  | report review/letter |      | 2.75       | \$206.25    |
| -2174a | 12/15/93  | report file review   |      | 1.5        | \$112.50    |
|        |           |                      |      |            | -----       |
|        |           |                      |      |            | \$787.50    |

Balance: \$163.50

Amount Refunded:

36784