

ALAMEDA COUNTY HAZARDOUS MATERIALS DIVISION
DEPOSIT / REFUND ACCOUNT SHEET

printed 12/10/96

SITE INFORMATION

Runnels Industries
3590 Enterprise Ave
Hayward 94545
Site Contact: A B Gant
Site Phone : 783-4171

StID: 6068 Site#: 1552
PROJECT#: 1552A
PROJECT TYPE: *** M ***
INSP: Madhulla Logan
ACCT. SHEET PG #: _____

PROPERTY OWNER INFORMATION

Owner Contact:
Owner Phone :

PAYOR INFORMATION

Runnels Industries
3590 Enterprise Ave
Hayward CA 94545 #*03
Payor Contact:
Payor Phone : 783-4171

Date	Action Taken	Time		Hours Spent/ Depstd	Hour Balnce	Money	
		In	Out			Spent/ Depositd	Money Balance
	Rcpt# 779452						
12/10/96	Deposit of \$1,500.00 @ \$94/hour			+15.95	+15.95	1,500.00	1,500.00
12/10/96	Admin. Charge: 1 hour <i>Site Visit</i>			1.00	14.95	94.00	1,406.00
12/18/96	<i>Review Report phase I</i>			2.00			
12/19/96	<i>Review Report phase II</i>			2.00			
12/23/96	<i>Review -></i>			2.00			
1/9/97	<i>Site visit -</i>			3.00			
	<i>Review</i>			2.0			
	<i>Letter</i>			1.0			
7/7/97	<i>Review addendum</i>			1.0			
7/7/97	<i>to workplan</i>			0.5			
	<i>phone conversation</i>						
10/23/97	<i>Review 9/30/97</i>			1.0			
8/1/99	<i>Review quarterly 3/1/99</i>			1.0			

UPON COMPLETION OF PROJECT
PROJ COMPLETED BY : _____ ATTACH: _____ State Forms A, B & C
Billing Adjustment*

DATE OF COMPLETION : _____ DATE SENT TO BILLING: _____
TOTAL COST OF PROJECT: _____ REFUND AMOUNT: _____ Rev. 7/96

Listing of HAZMAT - FULL SITE HISTORY since 1987 for StID # 6068
as of 07/25/2001 all Activity Codes

SITE NAME & ADDRESS:

Runnel's Industries -- 3590 Enterprise Ave , Hayward CA 94545

InspDat Insp Act InspT StID Proj# COMMENTS DailBDat
=====

Archived Dailies:

Current Dailies:

InspDat	Insp Act	InspT	StID	DRPro	Comment	DailBDat
12/18/1996	ML	75	2.	6068	1552A REVIEW REPORT PHASE I	*****
12/18/1996	ML	75	2.	6068	1552A review	*****
12/19/1996	ML	75	2.	6068	1552A review	*****
12/19/1996	ML	75	2.	6068	1552A REVIEW RPT PHASE II	*****
12/23/1996	ML	75	2.	6068	1552A review	*****
12/23/1996	ML	75	2.	6068	1552A REVIEW	*****
01/09/1997	ML	73	3.	6068	1552A SITE VISIT	*****
01/09/1997	ML	74	1.	6068	1552A LETTER	*****
01/09/1997	ML	75	2.	6068	1552A REVIEW	*****
01/09/1997	ML	77	3.	6068	1552A review and on-site visit	*****
01/16/1997	ML	75	3.	6068	1552A review and letter	*****
02/05/1997	ML	75	1.	6068	1552A administrative	*****
08/06/1997	TP	77	0.4	6068	1552A w/Gary Lowe, ML, review , workplan	*****
08/07/1997	ML	75	1.5	6068	1552A workplan review, and phone discussion	*****
10/23/1997	ML	75	1.	6068	1552A Review of 9/30/97 report	*****
04/06/1998	ML	74	1.	6068	1552A letter	*****
04/06/1998	ML	75	2.	6068	1552A review 9/6/97 report and documentation	*****
04/30/1998	ML	75	0.5	6068	1552A review workplan, phone discussion	*****
InspDat	Insp Act	InspT	StID	DRPro	Comment	DailBDat
12/09/1998	ML	75	1.	6068	1552A quarterly monitoring report review	*****
03/01/1999	ML	75	1.	6068	1552A 3RD QUARTERLY REPORT	*****
03/25/1999	ML	75	1.	6068	1552A review groundwater quarterly monitoring report	*****
06/01/1999	ML	75	1.	6068	1552A review groundwater monitoring report	*****
02/15/2000	EC	71	0.5	6068	1552A start file review	
02/16/2000	EC	71	0.7	6068	1552A cont rev of file	
02/17/2000	EC	71	2.	6068	1552A cont site hist/rev	
02/18/2000	EC	71	1.	6068	1552A cont site hist	
02/23/2000	EC	77	4.	6068	1552A complete site hist	
03/03/2000	EC	77	1.4	6068	1552a msg to g lowe. hvocs still no delineated. msg to acwd. disc w/ r brewer. he oked no delineation if not water source/sensitive receptors	
03/08/2000	EC	77	1.	6068	1552A process \$. disc items needed for closure w/ g lowe	
04/18/2000	EC	77	0.8	6068	1552a do well survey on map info for g lowe	
InspDat	Insp Act	InspT	StID	DRPro	Comment	DailBDat
05/02/2000	EC	77	0.6	6068	1552A rev ltr from g lowe. prepare	

Printed: 07/25/2001

***** Alameda County Department of Environmental Health *****
Deposit/Refund Account History

** PROJECT INFORMATION **

Project#: --1552A Date Open: 12/10/1996 Date Closed:

Payor Information:

Site Information:

RUNNELS INDUSTRIES, INC.
3590 ENTERPRISE AVENUE
HAYWARD CA 94545

ENTERPRISE AVE.PROPERTY
3590 ENTERPRISE AVENUE
HAYWARD CA 94590

** DEPOSIT HISTORY **

Deposit Date	Receipt#	Amount Received
-----	-----	-----
12/10/1996	779452	\$ 1,500.00
06/04/1998	805871	\$ 981.60
06/10/1998	805897	\$ 940.00
03/08/2000	842475	\$ 1,500.00

		\$ 4,921.60

** WORKLOG HISTORY **

Work Date	Insp	Activity Description / Time Spent (hrs)	Amount Charged
-----	-----	-----	-----
12/10/1996	adm	administrative charge	1. 94.0
12/18/1996	ML	Review Plans/Reports	2. 188.0
12/19/1996	ML	Review Plans/Reports	2. 188.0
12/23/1996	ML	Review Plans/Reports	2. 188.0
01/09/1997	ML	Investigation On-Site	3. 282.0
01/09/1997	ML	Write Letters	1. 94.0
01/09/1997	ML	Review Plans/Reports	2. 188.0
01/09/1997	ML	Meetings, Consultations	3. 282.0
01/16/1997	ML	Review Plans/Reports	3. 282.0
02/05/1997	ML	Review Plans/Reports	1. 94.0
08/06/1997	TP	Meetings, Consultations	0.4 37.6
08/07/1997	ML	Review Plans/Reports	1.5 141.0
10/23/1997	ML	Review Plans/Reports	1. 94.0
04/06/1998	ML	74 -WRITE LETTERS	1. 94.0
04/06/1998	ML	75 -REVIEW 9/6/97 REPORT& DOCUMENTATION	2. 188.0
04/30/1998	ML	75 -RVW WRKPLN, PH. DISCUSSION	0.5 47.0
12/08/1998	ML	Review Plans/Reports	1. 100.0
03/01/1999	ml	3rd quarterly report	1. 100.0
03/25/1999	ml	review groundwater monitor report	1. 100.0
06/01/1999	ml	Review Plans/Reports	1. 100.0
06/01/1999	ml	Review Plans/Reports	1. 100.0

InspDat	Insp Act	InspT	StID	DRPro	Comment	DailBDat
05/08/2000	EC	77	0.3	6068	1552A	answers.
06/02/2000	EC	77	0.3	6068	1552b	clarify pts w/ g lowe
06/16/2000	EC	77	1.3	6068	1552a	disc ust case w/ h murphy
						rev ltr from lowe. rev hist.
						ask for dissolved metals from mw-1
07/03/2000	EC	77	1.	6068	1552a	rev rtp from g lowe. compare 1,1 dce #s w/ rwqcb and oak's rbsl. pas oak but not rwqcb
07/14/2000	EC	77	2.2	6068	1552B	rev. add to site hist. disc 95% ucl for 1,1 DCE q/ brewer
07/31/2000	EC	77	0.4	6068	1552a	ask lowe to do 95% ucl and ask r brewer fro guidance on ucl
08/28/2000	EC	77	0.7	6068	1552B	rev email from roger. fax him info on soil data
01/11/2001	EC	77	0.9	6068	1552a	rev. upd slic info to rwqcb
01/31/2001	EC	77	0.2	6068	1552a	rept on adj site comping soon per r brewer. will be done by r kitay
02/06/2001	EC	77	0.2	6068	1552a	kitay has voc plume map for
						vicinity but he says to look at rwqcb's copy on 2/14/01
02/14/2001	EC	77	0.5	6068	1552A	disc site and rev data from upgradient site w/ r brewer. need freon analysis
02/20/2001	EC	77	0.6	6068	1552A	disc freon 113 and tce w/ g lowe. rev clayton's rpt
02/21/2001	EC	77	2.	6068	1552A	research freon 113. rev and upd site hist
02/27/2001	EC	77	0.3	6068	1552A	ask gant for signed statement that hvocs were never used at his site
02/28/2001	EC	77	0.2	6068	1552A	al gant will send ltr

↓
\$105/hr

Complete

04/18/2000	EC	Meetings, Consultations	0.8	80.0
05/02/2000	EC	Meetings, Consultations	0.6	60.0
05/08/2000	EC	Meetings, Consultations	0.3	30.0
06/02/2000	EC	Meetings, Consultations	0.3	30.0
06/16/2000	EC	Meetings, Consultations	1.3	130.0

			\$	3,311.60

Balance:\$ 1,610.00 Amount Refunded: \$